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Invitation to bid (goods)

ITB section 1: Bid data sheet
ITB UNOPS-RS0OC-2015-G-018

Date: 20 May 2015

Provision of ICT equipment for UNOPS RSOC office
ITB No.UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

Section 1: Bid data

Bid number:
Project:

Procurement official’'s name:;

Email:

Telephone number:
Facsimile:

Issue date:

ITB-UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018
00090845, 88112, 90061, 85495, 84132
Suzana Tanaskovic
suzanat@unops.org

+38111 2445-687

+38111 2445-687

20 May 2015

Pre-bid conference / site visit = NOT APPLICABLE

Requests for clarifications due Requests for clarification from bidders will not be accepted any later
than 4 days before the Deadline for Bid Submission.

UNOPS clarifications to bidders due Responses to requests for clarification shall be communicated

to bidders by posting responses on LBHT web site (http://www.sagradimodom.org) and European
PROGRES website (www.eupropeanprogres.org) under ITB Case No. UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-

018.
Bid due:
Date:
Time:
Planned award date:
Date:

08 June 2015
12:00h noon, CET

June 2015

Planned contract start date delivery date (on or before)

Date:

June 2015
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ITB section 2: ITB letter
ITB UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

Invitation to bid (goods)
Provision of ICT equipment for UNOPS RSOC office

ITB No. UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

Section 2: ITB letter

UNOPS plans to procure ICT equipment for UNOPS RSOC office as defined and in accordance with
these documents. UNOPS now invites sealed bids from qualified bidders for providing the requirements
as defined in the UNOPS specification attached hereto. Bids must be received by UNOPS at the
address specified not later than 12:00 a.m. CET (Serbian time zone UTC+01:00) on 08 June 2015.

This ITB is conducted in accordance with the UNOPS Procurement Manual and all other relevant
directives and issuances and can be accessed by following the below link. For clarification on specific
issues or to learn more details about procurement at UNOPS bidders are encouraged to consult the
UNOPS Procurement Manual. In case of contradictions between this ITB and the UNOPS Procurement
Manual, the UNOPS Procurement Manual shall prevail.

http://www.unops.org/SiteCollectionDocuments/Procurement/UNOPS %20procurement%20manual%20
EN.pdf

This UNOPS ITB consists of five sections and a series of annexes which will be completed by bidders
and returned with their bid:

ITB Section 1: Bid data sheet

ITB Section 2: ITB letter (this document)

ITB Section 3: Instructions to bidders

ITB Section 4: UNOPS technical specifications

ITB Section 5:  UNOPS General Conditions of Contract for Goods

Annex A Bid/No Bid Confirmation Form

Annex B Check List Form

Annex C Bid Submission, Technical and Price Schedule Offer Form
Annex D UNGM Vendor registration form

Interested bidders may obtain further information by contacting this email address:
srpc.procurement@unops.org

Pre-cleared by: Approved by:

Date: 70 / @(/ 2040 Date: \

S 9 f
T AT .-ir_"___.(.thff
Bozidar Radivojevic Graeme Tyndall
Procurement Officer UNOPS Serbia Operations Centre Manager
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GG ITB section 3: Instructions to bidders
L ITB UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

Invitation to bid (goods)
Provision of ICT equipment for UNOPS RSOC office

ITB No.UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

Section 3: Instructions to bidders

1.1. Introduction

UNOPS means the United Nations Office for Project Services, with offices located in more than 80
countries worldwide.

Effective with the release of this ITB, all communications must be directed only to UNOPS Procurement
Unit by email at srpc.procurement@unops.org. Bidders must not communicate with any other
personnel of UNOPS regarding this ITB.

1.2 Eligibility and pre-qualification criteria

Bidders must not be associated, or have been associated in the past, directly or indirectly, with a firm
or any of its affiliates which have been engaged by UNOPS to provide consulting services for the
preparation of the design, specifications, and other documents to be used for the procurement of the
goods under this invitation to bid.

Bidders must not be under a declaration of ineligibility for corrupt and fraudulent practices published
by UNOPS on its website. Bidders must meet the eligibility criteria as published on the UNOPS
website.

When the bidder is not the manufacturer of the goods, and if so required in the UNOPS technical
specifications/statement of work (section 4 of this ITB) the bidder shall be duly authorized by the
manufacturer of the goods to submit this bid by completing annex J and returning it with its bid,
assuring full guarantee and warranty obligations as per the contract.

The bidder must have the required and relevant experience and financial and production capability
necessary to perform the contract as specified in the UNOPS technical specifications/statement of
work (section 4 of this ITB)

Bidders may be disqualified if they have made misleading or false representations in the forms,
statements and attachments submitted in proof of the qualification requirements; and/or record of poor
performance such as, not properly completing contracts, inordinate delays in completion, litigation
history, financial failures etc.

1.3. Cost of bid

The bidder shall bear all costs associated with the preparation and submission of its bid. UNOPS will in
no case be responsible or liable for those costs, regardless of the conduct or outcome of the
solicitation process.

1.4. Content of solicitation documents

The goods required, bid procedures and contract terms are prescribed in these solicitation documents,
contents of which are listed in the cover section, invitation to bid.

Bids must offer goods for the total requirement, unless otherwise permitted in the solicitation
document. Bids offering only part of the goods may be rejected unless permitted otherwise in the
solicitation document. The bidder is expected to examine all corresponding instructions, forms, terms
and specifications contained in the solicitation documents. Failure to furnish all information required by

4 of 22



|TB section 3: Instructions to bidders
ITB UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

these documents or submission of a bid that does not comply with these documents will be at the
bidder's risk and may affect the evaluation of the bid.

1.5. Clarification of solicitation documents

1.5.1. A prospective bidder requiring any clarification of the solicitation documents may notify UNOPS
in writing at UNOPS mailing address or email address indicated in the ITB indicated in the ITB. UNOPS
will respond in writing to any request for clarification of the solicitation documents that it receives by the

due date outlined on page 1. Written copies of UNOPS response (including an explanation of the query
but without identifying the source of inquiry) will be sent to all prospective bidders that have received the
solicitation documents.

If the ITB has been advertised publicly, the results of any clarification exercise (including an
explanation of the query but without identifying the source of inquiry) will be posted on the
www.europeanprogres.org and www.sagradimodom.org web sites.

1.6. Amendments of solicitation documents

At any time prior to the deadline for submission of bids, UNOPS may, for any reason, whether at its
own initiative or in response to a clarification requested by a prospective bidder, modify the solicitation
documents by amendment.

All prospective bidders that have received the solicitation documents will be notified in writing of all
amendments to the solicitation documents. For open competitions, all amendments will be posted on
the UNOPS website in the tender notice.

In order to afford prospective bidders reasonable time in which to take the amendment into account in
preparing their bids, UNOPS may, at its discretion, extend the deadline for the submission of bid.
UNOPS may, at its discretion, cancel the requirement in part or in whole.

1.7. Language of bids

The bids prepared by the bidder and all correspondence and documents relating to the bid exchanged
by the bidder and UNOPS, shall be written in English. Supporting documents and printed literature
furnished by the bidder may be in another language provided they are accompanied by an appropriate
translation of all relevant passages in English. In any such case, for interpretation of the bid, the
translation shall prevail. The sole responsibility for translation and the accuracy thereof shall rest with
the bidder.

5of 22
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VTN ITB section 3: Instructions to bidders
j a7 ITB UNOPS-RS0OC-2015-G-018

1.8. Documents comprising the bid

Bidders shall not submit more than one bid per bidder in this ITB process, with the exception of
alternative offers if so provided for in ITB Section 4, UNOPS technical specifications.

The bid prepared by the bidder shail comprise the following components:

ITB submission (on or before bid due date) 12:00 a.m. CET (Serbian time zone UTC+01:00) on 08
June 2015:

As a minimum, bidders shall complete and return the below listed documents (annexes to this ITB) as
an integral part of their bid. Bidders may add additional documentation to their bids as they deem
appropriate.

Failure to complete and return the below listed documents as part of the bid may result in bid rejection.

| Part of bid Check list form (Annex B hereto)
Part of bid Signed Bid submission, technical and price schedule offer form (Annex C hereto)

If after assessing this opportunity you have made the determination not to submit your bid we would
appreciate if you could return this form indicating your reasons for non-participation.

Pre-submission:
Bidders are requested to complete and return the Bid/No Bid Confirmation Form prior to the
submission deadline indicating whether they do or do not intend to bid.

Stand-alone

document Bid/no bid confirmation form (Annex A hereto)

1.9. Bid prices

The bidder shall indicate on the appropriate bid price sheet contained in these solicitation documents
the prices of the goods it proposes to supply under the contract.

The price of the goods shall be quoted as per Incoterms mentioned in the Price Schedule Form.

Fixed price: Prices quoted by the bidder shall be fixed during the bidder's performance of the contract
and not subject to variation on any account. A bid submitted with an adjustable price quotation will be
treated as non-responsive and rejected, pursuant to ITB Clause 24.

1.10. Bid currencies

All prices shall be quoted in RSD — Republic of Serbia Dinar for domestic companies and in USD (US
Dollar) for foreign companies.

UNOPS reserves the right not to reject any bids submitted in another currency than the mandatory
bidding currency stated above. UNOPS may accept bids submitted in another currency than stated
above if the bidder confirms during clarification of bids (1.18) in writing that it will accept a contract

issued in the mandatory bid currency and that for conversion the official United Nations operational
rate of exchange of the day of ITB deadline as stated in the ITB letter shall apply.

Regardless of the currency of bids received, the contract will always be issued and subsequent
payments will be made in the mandatory bidding currency above.

1.11.  Bid security - DOES NOT APPLY TO THIS ITB

UNOPS v2014.2
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ITB section 3. Instructions to bidders
ITB UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

1.12.  Period of validity of bids

Bids shall remain valid for 120 days after the date of bid submission prescribed by UNOPS, pursuant
to the deadline clause. A bid valid for a shorter period may be rejected.

In exceptional circumstances, UNOPS may solicit the bidder's consent to an extension of the period
of validity. The request and the responses thereto shall be made in writing. Bid security provided
shall also be suitably extended. A bidder may refuse the request without forfeiting its bid security.

1.13. Format and signing of bids

The bid shall be typed or written in indelible ink and shall be signed by the bidder or a person or
persons duly authorized to bind the bidder to the contract. The latter authorization shall be indicated by
written power-of-attorney accompanying the bid.

A bid shall contain no interlineations, erasures, or overwriting except as necessary to correct errors
made by the bidder, in which case such corrections shall be initialled by the person or persons
signing the bid.

1.14. Sealing and marking of bids
The bidder shall seal the bid in an envelope, as detailed below:

Any envelope should be marked with ITB-UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018 and be addressed as follows
for mailing or hand deliveries:

***CONFIDENTIAL BID - DO NOT OPEN UNLESS AUTHORIZED UNOPS RSOC***
United Nations Office for Project Services
Sumatovacka 59, 11 000 Belgrade

Republic of Serbia
Att.: Chair Person, Proposal Opening Committee. Case No.: UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

If the envelope is not sealed and marked as per the instructions in this clause, UNOPS does not
assume responsibility for the bid's misplacement or premature opening.

1.15. Deadline for submission of bids

Bids must be received by UNOPS at the email address/office address specified under clause sealing
and marking of bids not later than 12:00 a.m. CET (Serbian time zone UTC+01:00) on 08 June 2015.
All bids will be opened shortly thereafter.

UNOPS may, at its discretion, extend this deadline for the submission of bids by amending the
solicitation documents in accordance with clause Amendment of solicitation documents, in which case
all rights and obligations of UNOPS and bidders previously subject to the deadline will thereafter be
subject to the deadline as extended.

1.16. Late bid

Any bids received by UNOPS after the deadline for submission of bids prescribed by UNOPS,
pursuant to clause “Deadline for submission of bids”, will be rejected. Where a bid security was
requested any such bid security will be returned to the bidder after contract award has been made.

1.17. Modification and withdrawal of bids

The bidder may withdraw their bid after the bid's submission, provided that written notice of the
withdrawal is received by UNOPS prior to the deadline prescribed for submission of bids.

The bidder's withdrawal notice shall be prepared, sealed, marked, and dispatched in accordance
with the provisions of the clause ‘Deadline for submission of bids’. No bid may be modified
subsequent to the deadline for submission of bids. No bid may be withdrawn in the interval between
the deadline for submission of bids and the expiration of the period of bid validity.

1.18. Clarification of bids
7 of 22



ITB section 3: Instructions to bidders
ITB UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

To assist in the examination, evaluation and comparison of bids, UNOPS may, at its discretion, ask
the bidder for a clarification of its bid. The request for clarification and the response shall be in
writing and no change in the price or substance of the bid shall be sought, offered or permitted.
UNOPS will review minor informalities, errors, clerical mistakes, apparent errors in price and missing
documents in accordance with the UNOPS Procurement Manual 8.9 Discussions with vendors.

1.19. Preliminary screening

UNOPS will examine the bids to determine whether they are complete, the documents have been
properly signed, the bids are generally in order, and there are no computational errors in the Price
Schedule.

1.20. Determination of compliance

Compliance refers to whether or not the bid substantially meets the quantitatively and qualitatively
defined criteria as per the requirements and other qualification criteria as stated in the solicitation
documents. If the offer complies with all the criteria specified in the solicitation documents such as pre-
qualification and eligibility requirements, the offer is deemed substantially compliant.

1.21. Evaluation steps

All bids found substantially compliant with the formal criteria under 1.19 Preliminary screening will go
through subsequent evaluation as follows:

a. Pre-qualification and eligibility criteria as outlined in the UNOPS technical
specifications/statement of work as contained in this ITB are evaluated prior to technical
and financial evaluation. Only bids meeting the minimum pre-qualification and eligibility
criteria will be evaluated further.

b. Technical evaluation will be conducted to establish substantial compliance. When the
specifications of the item/s quoted vary in one or more significant aspect/s from the
minimum required technical specifications, the bid will not be considered substantially
compliant and will not be evaluated further.

c. The prices of bids found to be substantially compliant will be compared to identify the most
substantially compliant bid which represents the lowest overall costs to UNOPS.

1.22. Award criteria

Bidders must meet all the mandatory business criteria outlined in Annex C UNOPS technical
specifications. The qualifications will be evaluated by UNOPS and bidders determined to have met
all mandatory requirements will be considered for award.

UNOPS will award the contract to the best qualified contractor whose bid substantially conforms to the
requirements set forth in the solicitation documents and offers the lowest overall cost to UNOPS.
UNOPS reserves the right to conduct negotiations with the vendor regarding the contents of their
offer. UNOPS reserves the right to accept or reject any bid, and to annul the solicitation process and
reject all bids at any time prior to award of contract, without thereby incurring any liability to the
affected bidder or bidders or any obligation to inform the affected bidder or bidders of the grounds for
UNOPS action.

1.23  UNOPS right to vary quantities at time of award

At the time the contract is awarded, UNOPS reserves the right to increase or decrease the quantity
of goods and related services originally specified in Section 4, Technical specifications/SOW,
provided this does not exceed the percentages specified in Section 4, Technical specifications/SOW,
and without any change in the unit prices or other terms and conditions of the bid and the bidding
documents.
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ITB section 3: Instructions to bidders
ITB UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

1.24 Notification of award

Prior to the expiration of the period of bid validity, UNOPS will notify the successful bidder in writing by
email or letter, that its bid has been accepted. The notifications of award will constitute the formation of
the contract. Please note that the bidder will be required to complete registration on the UNGM prior to
the signature and finalization of the contract.

1.25  Signing of contract

At the same time as UNOPS notifies a successful bidder that its bid has been accepted, UNOPS will
invite the bidder, provided the bidder is successfully registered on the UNGM, to sign the finai version
of the Contract Form provided in the solicitation documents, incorporating all agreements between the

parties.
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ITB section 4: UNOPS technical specifications
ITB UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

Invitation to bid (goods)
Provision of ICT equipment for UNOPS RSOC office

ITB No.UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

Section 4: UNOPS technical specifications

A. Summary of requirements

Equipment List
Item Total

z
o

SERVER Computer

SERVER Computer for small network

DESKTOP Computer

Advanced Laptop PC with accessories and
_docking station

Standard Laptop PC with accessories and docking 20

station

Height adjustable LCD Display 15

Network data storage (NAS - Network Attached 2

Storage) with 4x2TB hard drives

Dual WAN / VPN load balancing router
Wireless Access point

Managed work switch

Fax

N
G|~ [W(IN

— —
~lo|olw| N (o] o
NN TR INY

NOTE: All items must comply with requirements laid down in the technical specifications. The required
specifications present minimum requirements. Bidders may offer items with more advanced specs and such
offers are accepted as appropriate.

Manufacturer's technical literature submitted with the offer must comply with the written specifications of the
Bidder. In the event that there are differences between the submitted manufacturers’ literature and written
Bidder specification reasons for that must be explained in the Bidder specifications. Manufacturer's technical
literature (brochures, booklets, instructions, etc.) should be submitted for each item offered (if applicable).
The manufacturers’ technical literature should be marked in an appropriate manner (i.e. model number - if
applicable).

Bidder warrants that offerd equipment is new and unused. Bidder shall further warrant that none of the
supplies have any defect arising from design, materials or workmanship.

Where applicable items must be in compliance with the Law on health safety of products for general use
Republic of Serbia.

Based on Clause 1.23 of the ITB section 3: Instructions to bidders, UNOPS reserves the right to increase or

decrease the quantity of goods and related services originally specified in Section 4, Technical specifications
and without any change in the unit prices or other terms and conditions of the bid and the bidding documents.

Bids per item are allowed. UNOPS reserves the right to make multiple contracts per items for this
purchase.

UNOPS v2014.2 10 of 22



ITB section 4: UNOPS technical specifications
ITB UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

For the ITB purposes the bidder shall provide the following documentary evidence:

1. Financial capability of the company
- Document from Business Registers Agency (APR) not older than 6 months

- Tax administration receipt that the company paid all local and national taxes (not older than 6
months)

- Financial statements and solvency reports for last 3 years to be provided.

2. Experience and technical capacity

- Atleast 3 similar contracts executed successfully during the last 5 years. Reference letters to be
provided.

- Bidder should be in continuous business of manufacturing / supplying the specific product
during the last 3 (three) years prior to bid opening.

- Bidders shall provide catalogue, brochure or similar document that will prove the required
technical characteristics of the product offered.

B. Drawings

These bidding documents include no drawings.

C. Inspections and tests

There are no specific requirements related to inspections and tests.

D. Manufacturer’s authorization form

Manufacturer’s authorization is not required.

UNOPS v2014.2 11 of 22



ITB section 5: UNOPS GCC
UNOPS-RS0OC-2015-G-018

Invitation to bid (goods)

Provision of ICT equipment for UNOPS RSOC office
ITB No.UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

Section 5: UNOPS General Conditions of Contract

In the event of an order, the UNOPS General Conditions of Contract will apply. The conditions are
available at: http://www.unops.org/english/whatweneed/Pages/Guidelinesforsuppliers.aspx under “what
we need” > “Information for vendors” > “UNOPS General Conditions of Goods”. If your company is
unable to access the document, please send an email request to: srpc.procurement@unops.org and the
UNOPS General Conditions of Contract will be sent to you electronically.

UNOPS v2014.2 12 of 22



ANNEX A

ANNEX A
ITB UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

Invitation to bid (goods)
Provision of ICT equipment for UNOPS RSOC office

ITB No.UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

Bid/no bid confirmation form

If after assessing this opportunity you have made the determination not to submit your bid we would appreciate
if you could return this form indicating your reasons for non-participation.

Date:
To: UNOPS Fax/email +381-11-243-5703
Suzana Tanaskovic suzanat@unops.org
From:

Subject  ITB-UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

YES, we intend to submit an offer.

NO, we are unable to submit a bid in response to the above mentioned invitation to bid due to the
reason(s) listed below:

—

—— e — — — —
N e e e e N S N

()
()

The requested products are not within our range of supply

We are unable to submit a competitive offer for the requested products at the moment
The requested products are not available at the moment

We cannot meet the requested specifications

We cannot offer the requested type of packing

We can only offer FCA prices

The information provided for quotation purposes is insufficient

Your ITB is too complicated

Insufficient time is allowed to prepare a quotation

We cannot meet the delivery requirements

We cannot adhere to your terms and conditions (please specify: payment terms,
request for performance security, etc.)

We do not export

Our production capacity is currently full

We are closed during the holiday season

We had to give priority to other clients’ requests

We do not sell directly but through distributors

We have no after-sales service available

The person handling the bids is away from the office

Other (please provide reasons)

We would like to receive future ITBs for this type of goods
We don't want to receive ITBs for this type of goods

If UNOPS has questions to the bidder concerning this NO BID, UNOPS should contact

Mr./Ms.(

), phone/email ( ), who will be able to assist.

UNOPS v2014.2 13 of 22



.ANNEX B

Invitation to bid (goods)

ANNEX B

ITB UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

Provision of ICT equipment for UNOPS RSOC office

ITB No.UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

Check list form

Bidders are requested to complete this form and return it as part of their bid submission.

Activity

Yes/No

Page no. in your
bid

Remark

Have you duly completed all the bidding forms
provided in the Instructions to bidders?

¢ Bid/no bid confirmation

¢ Bid submission, technical and price schedule
offer form

e UNGM Vendor registration

Have you provided the required information for
qualification purposes as contained in ITB
document 4: UNOPS Technical specifications/
including:

e Document from Business Registers Agency
(APR) not older than 6 months

e Tax administration receipt that the company
paid all local and national taxes (not older
than 6 months)

o Financial statements and solvency reports for
last 3 years to be provided

o 3 reference letters to be provided

e Catalogue, brochure or similar document that
will prove the required technical
characteristics of the product offered

UNOPS v2014.2
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R ANNEX C
&) ITB UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

ANNEX C

Invitation to bid (goods)
Provision of ICT equipment for UNOPS RSOC office

ITB No.UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

Bid submission, technical and price schedule offer form
Cover page
Bidders are requested to complete this form and return it as part of their bid submission.

This cover page, the specification and the price schedule form are an integral part of the bid submission form.
Bidders are expected to return signed as part of their bid. The bidder shall fill in this form in accordance with
the instructions indicated. No alterations to its format shall be permitted and no substitutions shall be
accepted.

Date:
ITB No.: UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

To: Procurement Unit
We, the undersigned, declare that:

a. We have examined and have no reservations to the bidding documents, including amendment No.:
(Insert the number and issuing date of each amendment),

b. We offer to supply in conformity with the bidding documents and in accordance with the delivery
schedules specified in the Schedule of Requirements the following goods and related services
(Insert a brief description of the goods and related services),

¢. The total price of our bid, excluding any discounts offered in item (d) below, is:
(Insert

the total bid price in words and figures, indicating the various amounts and the respective currencies),
d. The discounts offered and the methodology for their application are:
Discounts: If our bid is accepted, the following discounts shall apply:

(Specify in
detail each discount offered and the specific item of the Schedule of Requirements to which it applies.)

Methodology of application of the discounts: The discounts shall be applied using the following

method:
(Specify in detail the method that shall be used to apply the discounts);

e. Our bid shall be valid for the period of time specified in Instructions to Bidders Sub-Clause 20.1,
from the date fixed for the bid submission deadline in accordance with Instructions to Bidders Sub-
Clause 24.1, and it shall remain binding upon us and may be accepted at any time before the
expiration of that period;

f.  If our bid is accepted, we commit to obtain a performance security in accordance with Instructions
to Bidders Clause 44 and GCG Clause 12 for the due performance of the Contract,

We have no conflict of interest in accordance with Instructions to Bidders Sub-Clause 4.2;

Our firm, its affiliates or subsidiaries—including any subcontractors or suppliers for any part of the
contract—has not been declared ineligible by UNOPS, in accordance with Instructions to bidders

Sub-Clause 4.3;

i.  We understand that you are not bound to accept the lowest evaluated bid or any other bid that you
may receive.

UNOPS v2014.2 15 of 22



g ANNEX C
(&) ITB UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

i We have not offered and will not offer fees, gifts and/or favours of kind in exchange for this ITB and
will not engage in any such activity during the performance of any contract awarded.

Signed: (Insert signature of person whose name and capacity are shown)
In the capacity of (Insert legal capacity of person signing the Bid Submission Form)
Name: (Insert complete name of person signing the Bid Submission Form)
Duly authorized to sign the bid for and on behalf of; (Insert complete name of bidder)
Dated on day of . IEERR [insert date of signing]

UNOPS v2014.2 16 of 22
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ANNEX C
ITB: UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

Bid submission, technical and price schedule offer form

Bidders are requested to complete this form and return it as part of their bid submission.

Bidders shall fill in the enclosed forms in accordance with the instructions indicated.

Alternate bids will not be acceptable.

In the event of a supplier submitting more than one bid all bids marked alternative bids will be rejected and only

the basic bid will be evaluated.

Technical offer
Bidders are encouraged to include any additional information regarding the goods they offer in this section in
form of free text.

Comparative data/compliance table
To establish compliance of their bid with the UNOPS technical specifications/statement of work bidders must
complete the right column of the below table and the compliance confirmation statement:

UNOPS minimum technical requirements Bidders to fill-in

1.SERVER Computer, Storage and authentication server for
networks with up to 30 active users Item brand and model (full
model code)

International brand name manufacturer, Processor: Xeon E5-
2600 v2equivalent with 15MB processor cache, Memory: 32GB,
DDR4, Expandable to minimum 128 GB, Hard Disk Drives: 2 x
500 GB (Mirror) plus 2 x 2TB (Mirror) with adequate hardware
RAID controller, SFF SAS or SATA Hot Plug 2.5" disks; Min 6
hot plug HDD bays, Hardware RAID Controller 6GB/s; Optical
Drive: DVD-RW +/- Dual Layer; Network: 2 x Ethernet 1Gbit/s
(integrated network allowed), Ports: 8 USB 2.0,

Video-Out, Case Tower. Warranty: 3/3 (parts/labor), Local
support provided

Mouse, Optical w/ scroll wheel, USB

Keyboard: USB, UK 101 International

OS Microsoft Windows Server 2012 Standard, with 30 CALs
licenses, pre-installed

UPS

International brand name manufacturer

Battery power: minimum 1000 VA, minimum 4 A/C power
backup slots,

Warranty: 1/1 Local support provided

LCD Display

Size minimum 20 inches, Resolution 1600x900, Connectivity
VGA, Contrast 1000 :1 static, 250 cd/m2, Response 5ms,
Warranty min 1 year

2.SERVER Computer for small network, Storage and
authentication server for networks with up to 15 active users
Item brand and model (full model code), International brand
name manufacturer, Processor: Xeon E3-1240 equivalent with 8
MB processor cache, Memory: 8GB, DDR4, Expandable to
minimum 32 GB, Hard Disk Drives: 2 x 2TB (Mirror) with RAID
controller, SATA NHP 7200 rpm; Optical Drive: DVD-RW +/-
Dual Layer; Network: 2 x Ethernet 1Gbit/s (integrated network
allowed), Ports: 6 USB 2.0,

Video-Out, Case Tower. Warranty: 3/3 (parts/labor), Local
support provided.

Mouse, Optical w/ scroll wheel, USB

Keyboard: USB, UK 101 International
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OS Microsoft Windows Server 2012 Standard, with 10 CAL
licenses, pre-installed

UPS

International brand name manufacturer

Battery power: minimum 1000 VA, minimum 4 A/C power
backup slots,

Warranty: 1/1 Local support provided

LCD Display

Size minimum 20 inches, Resolution 1600x900, Connectivity
VGA, Contrast 1000 :1 static, 250 cd/m2, Response 5ms,
Warranty min 1 year

3.DESKTOP Computer Processor 4th Generation i5 processor
for desktop computers, 4GB RAM, 500 GB HDD, integrated
graphics allowed, , Win 7 Professional, optical DVD+/-RW Dual
Layer, combined multimedia card reader, integrated speakers,
connectivity 4x USB 2.0, 4xUSB 3.0, Gigabit Ethernet, Case
factor: microtower, Extension slots , phones output, microphone
input.

Warranty: 3/3/0

UPS - International brand name manufacturer, Battery power:
minimum 1000 VA, minimum 4 A/C power backup slot

Height adjustable LCD Display - LED technology, Screen size
21,5 inches -22 inches, Full HD Resolution 1920x1080,
response time max 5 ms, digital, contrast min 1:1000, interface
— VGA, video interface in accordance with laptop digital signal
video interface display port or HDMI — cable to be provided.
Height adjustable

Warranty: 1/1/0s, Warranty: 1/1 Local support provided

4.Advanced Laptop PC with accessories and docking
station - Processor 4th Generation i5 processor for mobile
computers, 4GB RAM (min 2 SODIMM slots), 128 GB SSD,
graphics, min 14 inches screen size, Win 7 Professional, optical
DVD+/-RW Dual Layer, combined multimedia card reader, web
camera , integrated sound and microphone, connectivity, 2xUSB
3.0 regular, digital video port (display port or HDMI), adapter to
HDMI (if non-HDMI built in), Wireless network adapter 802.11
b/g/n, Gigabit Ethernet, 720p HD webcam, Docking connector,
phones output, microphone input. Warranty: 3/3/0

Additional devices: professional laptop carriage bag, US
keyboard, mouse

5.Standard Laptop PC with accessories and docking station
Processor 4th Generation i5 processor for mobile computers,
4GB RAM (min 2 SODIMM slots), 500 GB HDD, graphics, min.
15 inches screen size, Win 7 Professional or Win 8.1
Professional, optical DVD+/-RW Dual Layer, combined
multimedia card reader, web camera , integrated sound and
microphone, connectivity 3xUSB 3.0 regular, 1 USB 3.0 with
charging, digital video port (display port or HDMI), Wireless
network adapter 802.11 b/g/n, Gigabit ethernet, 720p HD
webcam, Docking connector, phones output, microphone input.
Warranty: 3/3/0
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Additional devices: professional laptop carriage bag, US
keyboard, mouse

NOTE: Max weight of laptop with battery not to exceed 2.5 kg,

6.Height adjustable LCD Display - LED technology, Screen
size 21,5 inches -22 inches, Full HD Resolution 1920x1080,
response time max 5 ms, digital, contrast min 1:1000, interface
— VGA, video interface in accordance with laptop digital signal
video interface display port or HDMI — cable to be provided.
Height adjustable

Warranty: 1/1/0

7.Network data storage (NAS - Network Attached Storage)
with 4x2TB hard drives, Quad-core processor ,, min 2.0GHz,
8GB DDR RAM, 512MB Flash memory, Four hot-swap HDD
bays, Supported capacity 4x6TB, 4x Gigabit Ethernet, HDMI,
3x USB 3.0, RAID: Single Disk, JBOD, RAID O, 1, 5, 6, 10, 5 +
hot spare, Maximum users number up to 4096; Users groups
number — up to 512, Shared folders number — up to 512,
WEB(phpMyAdmin, MySQL)/File/Printer/FTP server, Download
client, 4x2TB NAS SATAIIl Hard drives (WD20EFRX-68EUZNO
(Red NASware 2.0 or compatible)

8.Dual WAN / VPN load balancing router.

Brand name manufacturer, Link failover, load balancing router
min 2 x Gigabit Ethernet WAN interfaces, min 2x Gigabit
Ethernet LAN interfaces, 1-to-1 NAT (10), Port forwarding, Port
triggering, Port address translation, VPN setup capability

9.Wireless Access point, 300 Mbit /sec, Dual band 2.4 Ghz, 5
Ghz, 1xGigabit Ethernet LAN, Replaceable antenna

10.Managed Network Switch, 10/100/1000MBps Ethernet x 24
ports + 2 SFP ports, Layer 2+ fully managed, Telnet, web based
GUI, Rackable

11.Fax, Internal memory to store 15 pages or more, 9600 bps
modem, plain A4 paper

Printing — film technology, copier option included,Minimum 10
phone numbers memary capacity, caller IN inchided

The offered products are in accordance with the required specifications and technical requirements:

YES NO

Any deviations must be listed below:
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Bid prices

Bidders to submit their financial bid by completing the price schedules

Bidders shall fill in these Price Schedule Forms in accordance with the instructions indicated. The list of line
items in column 1 of the Price Schedules shall coincide with the List of Goods specified by UNOPS in the
technical specifications.

Bidder's prices for goods (price without VAT to be entered by bidder):
Currency:
Description C()g Unit price DAP Total price DAP
(b) (a)x(b)
1 | SERVER Computer 2
5 SERVER Computer for small 3
network
3 | DESKTOP Computer 7
4 Advanced Laptop PC with 5
accessories and docking station
5 Standard Laptop PC with 20
accessories and docking station
6 | Height adjustable LCD Dispiay 15
Network data storage (NAS -
7 | Network Attached Storage) with 2
4x2TB hard drives
8 Dual WAN / VPN load balancing 2
router
g | Wireless Access point 3
10 | Managed Network Switch 1 B
11 | Fax 1
TOTAL:

Bid summary

Total firm DAP price - All items are to be delivered ASAP, but not later than 30 calendar days from
the contract signing, (DAP and supplier to cover the costs of custom clearance agency if needed)
to UNOPS RSOC office, Sumatovacka 59, Belgrade. Transport and offloading to be included in the
price.

Bidder's delivery data

Delivery time (DAP from the date of order) for all items

Maximum 30 calendar days upon All
signing the contract items

Warranty period — as specified for each
item in Comparative data/compliance
tahle

All
items
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ANNEX D

Invitation to bid (goods)
Provision of ICT equipment for UNOPS RSOC office

ITB No.UNOPS-RSOC-2015-G-018

UNGM vendor registration form

As part of the bid, it is desired that the bidder goes to the United Nations Global Marketplace (UNGM)
registration website: https://www.ungm.org/Registration/RegisterSupplier.aspx and fills out the registration.
If the bidder is already registered with UNGM, please provide your UNGM registration number

( ). Please ensure that your firm's information on UNGM is current.

Bidders need to familiarize themselves with the United Nations Supplier Code of Conduct. UNOPS
encourages all suppliers to subscribe to the United Nations Global Compact.

The bidder may still bid even if not registered with the UNGM. However, if the bidder is selected for contract
award, the bidder must register on the UNGM prior to contract signature.
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@ UNOPS

UNOPS Headquarters
Marmorvej 51

P.O. Box 2695

2100 Copenhagen
Denmark

Tel; +45 45 33 7500
Fax: +45 45 33 75 01




